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The Postgraduate Diploma in Teaching (PGDT) programme offered by
Open University Malaysia (OUM) is a one year professional teaching
qualification programme fully accredited by the Malaysian Qualifications
Agency (MQA). It is designed to meet the needs of those who possess a
tertiary qualification intending to pursue teaching profession but do not
hold any nationally-recognized teaching qualification. With PGDT and other
specified requirements they may be registered as teachers and granted
teaching permit upon application. According to Education Act 1996, no
person shall teach in an educational institution unless he or she is
registered as a teacher by the Registrar General. In short, PGDT enables
aspiring teachers to attain qualified teacher status.

PGDT’s current mode of delivery is blended, comprising face-to-face
tutorials, online learning and learning support and self-managed learning
with OUM’s modules and learning resources. Besides attending tutoring
sessions at one of the OUM’s learning centres, learners are also able to
access various kinds of learning materials and learning resources via
OUM’s online learning management system (LMS) known as myINSPIRE. It
provides an excellent platform for learners to perform self-managed
learning. Complementing this, learners are also assigned to a dedicated e-
Tutor/online-tutor to guide them and to provide consultation services in
areas related to their courses. The specific courses/modules under this
programme include Curriculum Development, Theories and Practices of
Teaching and Learning, Guidance and Counselling, Educational
Management, Educational Assessment, Instructional Technologies as well
as Emerging Technologies for Teaching and Learning. All these courses are
specially prepared to ensure that the aspiring teachers and educators are
able to acquire the necessary knowledge and skills that meet the learning
demands of the 21st century learners.

Towards the end of their study, learners will undergo a supervised
practicum or teaching practice in selected schools or institutions of
learning. The practicum emphasizes application of theories in actual
teaching and learning environment to equip learners with practical teaching
and classroom management skills. Overall, OUM’s PGDT learners are
expected to complete their 30 Credit hours within a year. Upon graduation,
learners will be awarded the Post Graduate Diploma in Teaching or
Diploma Lepasan Ijazah dalam Pengajaran.

Dr Rosinah Binti
Mahmood

Program Director

Tel (Office) :

03 7801 2179

Email :

rosinah_mahmood

@oum.edu.my

RM9,240.00

MORE INFO

New Programme (5)

Postgraduate Programme (26)

Undergraduate Programme (28)

Faculty of Business and

Management

Faculty of Education and Social

Sciences

Faculty of Applied Sciences

Price

Search Programmes

Search here...

Programme Categories

Filter by Faculty

| | |

myOUM

myOUM

Thank you for reaching out to

Open University Malaysia.


Got any questions? I'm happy to

help.

https://www.oum.edu.my/
https://www.oum.edu.my/programmes-offered-at-oum/
https://www.oum.edu.my/course-category/postgraduate-programme/
mailto:rosinah_mahmood@oum.edu.my
https://www.oum.edu.my/course-category/new-programme/
https://www.oum.edu.my/course-category/postgraduate-programme/
https://www.oum.edu.my/course-category/undergraduate-programme/
https://www.oum.edu.my/faculty-business-and-management/
https://www.oum.edu.my/faculty-education-and-social-sciences/
https://www.oum.edu.my/faculty-applied-sciences/
https://www.oum.edu.my/
https://myoum.oum.edu.my/


University Courses

Subject Name Credit Hours

Educational Leadership 3

Core Courses

Subject Name Credit Hours

Curriculum Development 3

Instructional Technology 3

Guidance and Counselling 3

Educational Management 3

Educational Assessment 3

Theories and Practices of Teaching and Learning 3

Emerging Technologies in Teaching and Learning 3

Practical Teaching 6

Reach Us At

 Menara OUM,


Block C, Kelana Centre Point,


Jalan SS7/19, Kelana Jaya,


47301 Petaling Jaya, Selangor


Malaysia

 +603-7801 1800(General Line)


+603-7801 2000 (Speed Line)


 +6012-303 9935 / +6019-357 9074


 admission@oum.edu.my


(Enquiries for New Intake & Registration Only)

Connect with us at        

Working Hours

Monday – Thursday:


8:30 am – 5:30 pm

Friday:


8:30 am – 12:30 pm

Marketing Office:


Monday – Sunday


9:00 am – 4:00 pm

Closed on public holidays

Learning Centres:


Tuesday – Sunday


9am – 5pm


Closed on Monday and public holidays
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